
PONDICHERRY UNIVERSITY 

ENGINEERING WING 

SCHEDULE OF WORK 

NAME OF WORK: Providing Aluminum Partition at first floor of the school of social 

science Seminar Hall For The Purpose Of CLIL and Women’s 

Cell 

Sl 
No: 

Description Qty Rate Unit Amount 

1 
21.
1.1.
1 

Providing and fixing aluminimum work for 
doors, windows, ventilators and partitions 
with extruded built up standard tubular 
sections / appropriate Z sections and other 
sections of approved make conforming to IS : 
733 and IS : 1285, fixed with rawl plugs and 
screws or with fixing clips, or with expansion 
hold fasteners including necessary filling up 
of gaps at junctions, at top, bottom and sides 
with required PVC / neoprene felt etc. 
Aluminimum sections shall be smooth, rust 
free, straight, mitred and jointed 
mechanically wherever required including 
cleat angle, Aluminimum snap beading for 
glazing / panelling, C.P. brass / stainless 
steel screws, all complete as per 
architectural drawings. (Glazing and 
panelling to be paid for separately) : For fixed 
portion. Anodised aluminimum (anodised 
transparent or dyed to required shade 
according to IS : 1868, Minimum anodic 
coating of grade AC 15) 

90.00 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Kg 

 

2 
21.
2.2 

Providing and fixing 9mm thick prelaminated  
particle board flat pressed three layer or\ 
graded wood particle board conforming to IS 
: 12823 grade 1 type II in panneling fixed in 
aluminimum doors, windows, shutters and 
partition frames with C.P. brass / stainless 
steel screws etc., complete as per 
architectural drawings. Prelaminated particle 
board with decorative lamination on both 
sides 

25.00 
 

sqm 
 

3 
14.
53.
1B 

Wall painting with plastic emulsion paint - 
Premium of approved brand and 
manufacture to give an even shade - One or 
more coats on old work 

150.00 
 

sqm 
 

 TOTAL    
 

 

Terms & Conditions: 

i) The rates specified are firm and not subject to any variation. 

ii) The work should be completed within 15 days.  

iii) Payment will be made only after completion of the entire work. 

iv) The material should be got approved before commencement of work. 

 

 

CONTRACTOR                                                                    EXECUTIVE ENGINEER 

 


